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31 Castlebrook Road NE, Calgary, Alberta - $499,900

Main Photo

Property Description

This home is a must see, located on a quiet street backing onto a greenspace in Castleridge, and only
blocks from schools, shopping and the great amenities of Prairie Winds Park - perfect for your family! As
you walk through the home you can sense the love and warmth it offers your family. The entire home
finishings were updated within the last 5 years including kitchen cabinets, concrete countertops, new vinyl
plank and tile floors, all trim and doors, paint, and bathrooms. Be welcomed into a HUGE living room that
can accommodate any seating or entertainment set up you need, along with space for a desk too! The big
bright windows allow light to flow through and fill the main floor with natural light. Continue on to the
spacious, functional, custom kitchen with great storage and new stove (2024). The eating bar counter is
open to the dining nook which has sliding patio doors leading to a large deck, making the space perfect for
entertaining or quiet relaxation in your large private yard on a pie lot. Whether it's the back deck or the
covered front porch, this home offers peaceful outdoor spaces to enjoy with family and friends. Watch the
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kids play in the yard, or gardeners can take advantage of the raised garden boxes, a greenhouse, and
fruit-bearing saskatoon bush and grape vine. The main floor also offers a 2 piece powder room for your
guests to the right of the front door. After taking the staircase, which has updated metal spindle railings,
on the second floor you'll find the main 4 piece bathroom and two bedrooms for the kids, before you get
lost in the spacious primary bedroom! In the basement, you'll find a large family room great as an TV or
entertainment room including an office area with built in desk. Another flex room would be perfect as a
gym, hobby or play space or guest room (non-egress window). There is an unfinished storage area and
bright laundry room thanks to a window, with newer washer and dryer from 2023 and water tank from
2017. Additional storage can be found below the stairs. There is ample street parking on top of the tandem
driveway with space for two vehicles. With this home, you can relax knowing the fence, siding, eaves and
windows were done in the last 4 years, and the roof only 10 years ago. The porch and deck were refinished
in 2025 and the landscape was spruced up with fresh bark mulch as well. Book your showing soon, this
great home won't last long!
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